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Remote Patient Monitoring and Access to 
Care 
Remote patient monitoring (RPM) facilitates the 
real-time collection and transmission of health data 
from a patient to the health care provider. RPM 
supports the management of a range of conditions, 
from chronic diseases to managing health following 
hospital discharge.1,2 RPM use is increasing; the 
number of Medicare enrollees using RPM was more 
than 10 times higher in 2022 than 2019.3 RPM tools 
include technology to track blood sugar levels in real 
time for patients with diabetes, blood pressure 
monitors for patients with hypertension, and mobile 
health applications to track stress levels for 
individuals receiving behavioral health services. 
This technology enables patients to receive health 
care interventions without physical travel. By 
facilitating the remote transmission of patient data, 
such as vital signs, RPM allows health care providers 
to monitor patients and intervene promptly, when 
necessary, potentially reducing hospital admissions.4 

RPM also minimizes the need for frequent in-person 
visits and improves patient education and medication 
adherence, particularly when combined with other 
strategies such as telephone-based counseling.5 

These findings indicate that RPM is useful for a 
variety of conditions. Tailored approaches are 
necessary to ensure high-quality, accessible health 
care. 

Using RPM for Chronic Disease 
Management 
RPM is particularly effective in managing chronic 
diseases, offering a robust approach for health care 
providers to regularly monitor patients with long-
term health conditions.6 Chronic diseases, such as 
diabetes and heart disease, require ongoing 
monitoring and management.7 The continuous data 
stream from a patient to their health care provider 
reates a comprehensive picture of the patient’s health 

status over time. For example, sending regular blood 
pressure readings allows for timely adjustments to 
treatment plans and early intervention when needed.8 

RPM empowers patients to take an active role in their 
health management. In some cases, such as using an 
integrated RPM model for managing heart failure, 
RPM can help providers and their patients to manage 
acute health episodes, resulting in reduced 
readmissions and emergency department visits.9 

Figure 1 shows that while RPM for diabetes and 
hypertension was associated with lower HbA1c and 
blood pressure testing, it was not associated with 
lower HbA1c or blood pressure control.10 

Figure 1. HbA1c and Blood Pressure Testing and Control 
with Remote Monitoring Use, 2018-202011 
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Patient Self-Management with RPM 
RPM significantly boosts patient self-management, 
which is a critical component in contemporary health 
care paradigms, particularly for those with chronic 
conditions.12 By enabling patients to actively 
monitor their health metrics, such as blood glucose 
levels, blood pressure, and heart rate, RPM helps 
patients become active participants in their health 
care and facilitates shared decision-making.13 This 
regular awareness fosters a sense of responsibility 
and control, motivating patients to adhere more 
closely to their treatment protocols and adjust their 
lifestyle to optimize their health.14 For example, 
during the post-partum period, RPM for 
hypertension management can improve patient 
engagement and adherence to treatment, which may 
ultimately enhance clinical outcomes.15 RPM data 
can also be used to personalize patient care plans, 
leading to tailored approaches for disease 
management.16 This proactive approach can improve 
health outcomes, such as helping postpartum patients 
with hypertension better manage their condition.17 

Figure 2 shows the percentage of postpartum women 
with hypertension who continued to use RPM to 
manage their condition following delivery.18 Nearly 
three-quarters of the patients continued to track their 
blood pressure three weeks post-partum, and more 
than two-thirds continued to do so a full month 
following delivery.19 

Figure 2. Percentage of Patients Continuing Postpartum 
Hypertension Management Using RPM from 2-5 Weeks 

and Beyond20 

Using RPM for Real-Time Data Collection 
Real-time data collection and timely intervention are 
significant advantages of RPM systems. Such 
capabilities are particularly beneficial for managing 
chronic conditions and post-surgical recovery, where 
sudden changes in health status can necessitate 
immediate medical attention. 21,22 One study shows 
that having patients communicate with health care 
professionals outside of a traditional care setting is 
helpful for patient engagement.23 For example, by 
providing early warning signs of potential health 
issues for patients managing heart failure, RPM 
enables health care providers to intervene before 
conditions worsen, thereby reducing hospital 
admissions.24 A proactive health care approach using 
telehealth and RPM for cardiovascular disease is 
comparable to in-person care for disease 
management and may provide additional benefits 
through increased communication and 
engagement.25 Figure 3 shows the effectiveness of a 
noninvasive telemonitoring and nurse telephone 
coaching program on reducing mortality for patients 
with multiple comorbid conditions.26 

Figure 3. Non-invasive Monitoring- Nurse Telephone 
Coaching Program Impact on Mortality27 
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